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TOP 10 TIPSTERS FEBRUARY 2018 
CLICK HERE FOR A LIVE INTERACTIVE LEAGUE TABLE

TODAY’S FREE SPORTS BETTING TIPS… 
Lucky 7 Naps

Win Bet - 14:25 Doncaster - Baden @ 13/2


Two Percent Club

Win Bet - 15:45 Newcastle (A.W) - Bollihope @ 2/1


Trend Betting

Each Way Bet - 16:30 Huntingdon - Blackbird @ 12/1
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Congratulations on your discovery of ZapTips a Sport and Betting experience like no 
other. It’s your ultimate sports betting buddy, it’s 100% FREE and it’s accessible by 
anyone with a smartphone!


Let’s Get Started… 

STEP 1 - Download the free “ZAPPAR APP” at the link below. It’s available on both iOS 
and Android.


https://www.zappar.com/getzappar  

STEP 2 - Print this page and cut out the ZapTips logo. Place the logo on your desk or 
anywhere else you want your daily news and tips to materialise.


STEP 3 - Open the ZAPPAR App on your smartphone and ZAP the ZapTips Logo from 
11:30 am each day to interact.


STEP 4 - Subscribe to our Free ZapTips Newsletter http://betfan.com/zaptips for 
EXCLUSIVE free offers and updates.

https://www.zappar.com/getzappar
http://betfan.com/zaptips
https://members.betfanplus.com/champions
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Any Three From Five Chasing Champions League Spots 
- By Ian Hudson


There are only four Premier League fixtures kicking off at the traditional time of 3pm 
on Saturday this weekend and the top six sides all feature in live televised fixtures. 
The programme could be key in determining which sides finish in the top four and 
qualify for the Champions league and Arsenal away to Tottenham look most 
vulnerable in this context. Surely this is Arsene Wenger’s last season in charge but he 
seems to have more lives than a cat with a double quota.


Arsenal are not playing in the Champions League for the first season since Wenger 
joined the club in 1996. The title winning days are behind him but even in the darkest 
seasons Arsenal did not have to face the ignominy of Europa League football. They 
are playing in the minor European competition this season but even that is not 
guaranteed next year. Losing to Tottenham would not only be a blow to local pride it 
could scupper Arsenal’s Champions League prospects for another season.


Tottenham have had their blip and are now unbeaten in six league fixtures. That run 
includes the humbling of Manchester United at Wembley and a crazy away draw to 
Liverpool last weekend. In the space of two minutes each of the three possible 
outcomes was favourite. Despite the highs and lows of the last five minutes 
Tottenham had played well enough in the second half to win the match.  They are one 
of just two sides (with Bournemouth) unbeaten in six starts.


Arsenal stayed in touch with the top four with a 5-1 win over Everton at home. 
However, that result could be more to do with the abject Everton defending than 
anything Arsenal produced in the final third. They had lost two of their previous three 
league fixtures and avoiding defeat away to Tottenham looks beyond them and 
Wenger could be gone sooner rather than later but certainly this summer. A drubbing 
at Tottenham would hardly appease the anti-Wenger brigade.


Antonio Conte doesn’t have a hope of surviving until the end of the season and as we 
speak Roman Abramovich could be sharpening the axe. Conte asked for a response 
against Watford and his team lost 4-1 to a side who had won once in 12 starts. A 
home defeat to West Brom on Monday Night Football could be the end for Conte and 
even a draw might not save his job and that could transpire. Conte could be out of 
work by Tuesday morning.


Despite being 13 points clear at the top of the table with 12 matches remaining 
Manchester City have failed to win half of their last six Premier League matches. 
Leicester are vying with Burnley to be the best of the rest and can improve their 
chances of finishing seventh by drawing at City. It is basically the same squad that 
won the league and in that amazing title-winning season they beat City on the road. 
Lightening won’t strike twice but Leicester can share the points.   
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Huddersfield have lost five league matches in succession and they are now finding 
their true level. Sadly that means an immediate return to the Championship so a win 
at home to Bournemouth is vital. The visitors are unbeaten in six and are now ninth in 
the table. Huddersfield need more than draws at home but that is the most likely 
outcome of this fixture. Huddersfield are the lowest scorers in the league so a goalless 
stalemate would not be a surprise.  


Manchester United are in second place, one position and five points ahead of 
Liverpool. Both clubs see Champions League qualification as a minimum requirement. 
The status quo should be maintained with away wins at Newcastle and Southampton. 
Tottenham can enhance their position but it looks dire for Chelsea and Arsenal and 
their managers could pay with their jobs. 


Today’s Sports Betting Preview - By Rick Elliott


Go USA In The Winter Olympics  

You can tell it’s a quiet night for football when our headline tip concerns some strange 
activities on snow and ice. However, it’s that time every four years when we get 
transfixed by men and women scrubbing the floor with a funny brush as a big stone 
heads towards a target and other big stones. For many the highlight of the Winter 
Olympics is not downhill skiing or ice hockey but the weird and wonderful “sport” of 
curling. From 4.30am tomorrow you can watch the mixed doubles round robin 
matches and surely that’s worth staying up late for or getting up early. My man on the 
inside (at the Racing Post) tells me UNITED STATES must be backed at 7/1 to win 
most medals in this year’s Winter Olympics but the best part for me is the curling.


It’s debatable whether darts is a sport or a pastime but sport is about exertion though 
others would disagree. There is a campaign to get darts introduced into the Olympics 
and it certainly requires great skill and concentration. The target for the triple 20 is tiny 
but the best darts players seem to get “three in the bed” at will. ONE HUNDRED AND 
EIIIIIGHTY! is a familiar sound when the darts is on and it is heard most often when 
Michael van Gerwen is at the ochre. One particular pundit calls the Dutch arrers 
professional the world’s greatest sportsman. That might be over egging his talent but 
MVG at 4/6 with Ladbrokes to win the Premier League which continues tonight is the 
bet of the day. 


EQUUS SECRETUS Is The Horse To Back At 8/1 

There’s £94,000 up for grabs in prize money over the seven races at the jumps 
meeting at Huntingdon which is a decent figure for a midweek fixture in February. 
Cheltenham is now the be all and end all and it's less than five weeks before the 
meeting that matters most. The best horses are rarely raced against each other 
outside the four days of the Festival and that’s why few British horses were sent to 

Tipster Champions League BetFan.com - Page �5

http://online.ladbrokes.com/promoRedirect?key=ej0xMzc3MTY0MyZsPTEzOTMzODYxJnA9MjE4NzA=
https://members.betfanplus.com/champions
http://BetFan.com


Ireland for the Dublin Racing Festival. The richest race of the day is the Class 1 
novices’ hurdle at Huntingdon (2.15pm). On ratings and form EQUUS SECRETUS is 
the horse to back at 8/1 with William Hill and then you can settle down to watch some 
curling in the middle of the night. 


Your Chance To Win Big - By Eddie Lloyd


Something a little different today as we look at the Sun Bets Free Correct Score 
Game. 


It’s free to enter and we have to guess the correct scores of 6 games. The weekend 
games, this week are -


Swansea v Burnley

West Ham v Watford

Everton v C Palace

Huddersfield v Bournemouth

Newcastle v Man Utd

Southampton v Liverpool


We’ve been through the stats and these are predictions for the six games -


Swansea v Burnley 2 - 1

West Ham v Watford 3 - 2

Everton v C Palace 1 - 0

Huddersfield v Bournemouth 1 - 3

Newcastle v Man Utd 1 - 2

Southampton v Liverpool 1 - 1


What do you think? Fancy those scores, or do you think they’ll be different?


You’ve got nothing to lose and everything to gain by playing this free game.


Sun Six - CLICK HERE For A Chance To WIN BIG!
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